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Simon: Hello! Why are you doing another interview? Why aren’t you doing some 
editing for the-inepedent-voice.org? 

Simon: Someone else did it for me! Not to worry, I have at least two topics to 
discuss. (For now).

Simon: Go on…

Simon: I read an article headline called ‘Woman, 110, shares her secret to a long 
life.’ I was thinking ‘Why is she keeping it a secret? That’s evil.’

Simon: Most people see women that age as sweet…

Simon: Exactly. But not her. She just wants everyone to die young.

Simon: Why?

Simon: I don’t know. Maybe she has arthritis and it’s getting to her too much.

Simon: That’s no excuse.

Simon: Of course. Just an explanation. 

Simon: What WAS her secret to a long life?

Simon: I don’t know, I didn’t read what she had to say. But could you blame me? 
Reading the thoughts of someone like that would make me feel uncomfortable.

Simon: I guess I couldn’t. It would be like reading a book by Ted Bundy.

Simon: Did he write a book?

Simon: Didn’t he write ‘How to kill people whilst looking like a school headmaster’?

Simon: Never heard of it.

Simon: Hm. I must have made that up. He does look like a headmaster, though. I 
really wouldn’t want to spend a detention with him, now I know what he did. 

Simon: Hypocrite much?

Simon: Right! He has no right to judge me for being late to school/forgetting my 
homework. I judge him!

Simon: He really has tarnished the image of all teachers.

Simon: Exactly. Now in parent’s meetings, teachers have to reassure everyone that 
Bundy copied them, not the other way round.

Simon: Even the name ‘Ted’ sounds harmless. Change Bundy to Fundy and you end 
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up with a name that is so sweet it’s comical. 

Simon: Ted Fundy? Sounds like a children’s entertainer…

Simon: Right!

Simon: What’s your other interview idea?

Simon: I can’t even begin to explain how I feel about the Youtube video ‘Why is blue 
so rare in nature’.

Simon: I’d have thought it was the most common colour…

Simon: Me too! There’s no doubt about it, it clearly is! It’s a well known fact the 
ocean takes up most of the world’s space, and the sky is pretty big, too.

Simon: Maybe the video was referring to black space. Not much blue there. 

Simon: But everyone knows space is black! Why watch a video about it?

Simon: Ah, but do you know WHY space is black?

Simon: Because of a lack of light.

Simon: Oh yeah. Blue stars are rare, though, I think. Well rarer than orange ones.

Simon: Wow. Please do make a Youtube video about how only a few stars are blue. 
Or how there may be relatively few stars that are blue, and about how space is 
black. I’m sure it will be amazing. 

Simon: There are hardly any blue trees.

Simon: Ok. Moving on, I’ve thought of a funny conversation: ‘Their pears are over 
there!’ ‘Where are the bears?’ ‘They’re are the PEARS!’

Simon: What’s funny about it?

Simon: The words sound similar. 

Simon: :) I like how you used all the three forms of ‘there’.

Simon: Thank you.

Simon: Remember how you said your uncle keeps floating upwards all the time?

Simon: Yes?

Simon: If that kept happening, how did he build the pyramids?

Simon: I don’t know. He’s a very humble man and he never talks about his 
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achievements. 

Simon: Any ideas?

Simon: Maybe he floated upwards as he carried the bricks or whatever, then 
dropped them in the right place…

Simon: But how did he get back down to Earth?

Simon: I’m sorry, I don’t know.

Simon: What a strange man.

Simon: Very. 

Simon: Are there any tracks on Iron Maiden’s new album you like?

Simon: ‘Hell on Earth’ is alright, but that’s it really. And of course, it…

Simon: … uses the E5, C5, D5, E5 chord progression.

Simon: Of course it does. Like many IM songs, it actually STARTS OFF with those 
chords. They get right to it. Ok, ok. To be fair, it really starts on the C5, then goes to 
D5, E5, then repeats, rather than beginning with the E. They’ve done a twist. 

Simon: What have you eaten today?

Simon: For one thing, I’ve had some beef jerky. It’s inspired two cow jokes, so keep 
your eyes peeled for them in the not so distant future… :O

Simon: Can I have one now, please?

Simon: Ohh, go on then. What do you call meat from an asshole cow?

Simon: What?

Simon: Beef jerky.

Simon: Oh, I get it. It’s very important you read the question carefully. 

Simon: That was one of my concerns.

Simon: What else have you eaten?

Simon: Nothing of any real interest. I do like Nobby’s Nuts, though. They’re probably 
the nicest nuts I’ve ever eaten, and I’ve had pistachio nuts!

Simon: Really, you’ve had pistachio nuts?

Simon: Right. And NNs are better than them.
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Simon: Jeez. How about that?

Simon: Expanding on my first idea, what’s with people holding the secret to a happy 
marriage, and the secret to happiness in general? Can’t we just share the ideas so 
we can grow as a society? How arrogant do you have to be to spoil everything, just 
so you can feel special?

Simon: Maybe the secret to happiness is illegal. Maybe that’s why it’s a secret.

Simon: Drugs, you mean?

Simon: Yeah.

Simon: No, drugs don’t make you happy. I want to make that ABSOLUTELY clear. 
Please realise I’m being clear.

Simon: Maybe you have more benign theories when it comes to achieving 
happiness? Please don’t mention pizza.

Simon: How I do achieve happiness? By going to the gym. And burgers.

Simon: Is that it?

Simon: Well I go to the gym most days, so it doesn’t matter.

Simon: I see.

Simon: I’m getting a burger today, after working out. With chilli sauce.

Simon: You’re working out with chilli sauce?

Simon: Yeah. It’s my own method.

Simon: I don’t understand…

Simon: I run with chilli sauce.

Simon: Why?

Simon: No, only joking. I have the sauce with food. Like a normal person.

Simon: Good. Hang on, doesn’t chilli get the adrenaline pumping?

Simon: I don’t know. That sounds like it could be true, at least.

Simon: Maybe chilli sauce WOULD help you when working out… It would give you 
an extra boost.

Simon: Huh…
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Simon: Not so dumb now, is it?

Simon: I apologise for tricking you. You were right; it wasn’t a true trick. You won. 

Simon: Thank you. Maybe you’d like to continue this little chat when the food is 
eaten?

Simon: :D

(A day passes)

Simon: How was your burger?

Simon: it was alright…

…

…

Simon: Ho hum…

Simon: Hum.

Simon: Hm.

Simon: Oh I know what to say…

Simon: Go on…

Simon: Ever heard of a strategic weapon?

Simon: Yes?

Simon: Surely all weapons are strategic. Otherwise they’d be pointless weapons.

Simon: I’ve never heard of a pointless weapon…

Simon: Right! Imagine knights charging at people with rubber lances.

Simon: Anything else to point out?

Simon: No, that’s it. Bye!


